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MTR Corporation welcomes Government’s decision  
on Tung Chung Line Extension 

 
The MTR Corporation welcomes the Government’s invitation to the Corporation to 
proceed with detailed planning and design of the Tung Chung Line Extension project. 
The Corporation has commenced procurement of the preliminary design. 
 
The Tung Chung Line Extension project comprises three components: i) a new 
intermediate Tung Chung East Station between Sunny Bay Station and Tung Chung 
Station, ii) an extension of the existing Tung Chung Line to a new terminal station at 
Tung Chung West, and iii) the Airport Railway Extended Overrun Tunnel (Remaining 
Section), i.e. an eastward extension of the existing overrun tunnels from Hong Kong 
Station.  The latter facilitates an increase in the Tung Chung Line train frequency in the 
future.  Construction is expected to commence in 2023. 
 
The newly-added Tung Chung East Station will be a key component of the transport 
infrastructure to support the Tung Chung New Town Extension (East) development. 
Tung Chung West Station, located west of the existing Yat Tung Estate, will serve 
incumbent residents and potential housing developments nearby, including the Tung 
Chung New Town Extension (West) planning areas.  
 
“The Tung Chung Line Extension Project will benefit incumbent and future residents on 
North Lantau by improving the accessibility and providing railway connectivity to the 
core of Hong Kong.  Together with the existing Tung Chung Station, the three stations 
in Tung Chung will also form an important transport infrastructure serving the 
community of the expanded Tung Chung New Town with due consideration of 
Government’s land and housing supply programme,” said Dr Jacob Kam, Chief Executive 
Officer of MTR Corporation.  
 
The Corporation will continue to work closely with the Government to consult the local 
communities and listen to their views, so that the railway will be built to cater for the 
transport need of the residents and facilitate their daily commute.  
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About MTR Corporation 

Every day, MTR connects people and communities. As a recognised world-class operator of sustainable rail transport services, we are a leader 

in safety, reliability, customer service and efficiency. 

MTR has extensive end-to-end railway expertise with more than 40 years of railway projects experience from design to planning and 

construction through to commissioning, maintenance and operations. Going beyond railway delivery and operation, MTR also creates and 

manages dynamic communities around its network through seamless integration of rail, commercial and property development. 

With more than 40,000 dedicated staff*, MTR carries over 13 million passenger journeys worldwide every weekday in Hong Kong, the United 

Kingdom, Sweden, Australia and the Mainland of China. MTR strives to grow and connect communities for a better future.  

For more information about MTR Corporation, please visit www.mtr.com.hk. 

*includes our subsidiaries and associates in Hong Kong and worldwide 
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